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Mother Teresa's life sounds like a legend. The Albanian girl who entered an Irish order to go to India as a
missionary and became an "Angel of the Poor" for countless people. She was greatly revered by Christians as
well as Muslims, Hindus and unbelievers, as she brought the message of Christian love for one's neighbor
from the slums of Calcutta to the whole world.

Fr. Leo Maasburg was there as her close companion for many years, traveling with her throughout the world
and was witness to countless miracles and incredible little-known occurrences. In this personal portrait of the
beloved nun, he presents fifty amazing stories about her that most people have never heard, wonderful and
delightful stories about miracles, small and great, that he was privileged to experience at Mother Teresa's
side. Stories of how, without a penny to her name, she started an orphanage in Spain, and at the same time
saved a declining railroad company from ruin, and so many more.

They all tell of her limitless trust in God's love, of the way the power of faith can move mountains, and of
hope that can never die. These stories reveal a humorous, gifted, wise and arresting woman who has a
message of real hope for our time. It's the life story of one of the most important women of the 20th century
as it s never been told before. Illustrated with photos.
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From reader reviews:

Alicia Gentry:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-book
has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Think about the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or
maybe exercise. Well, probably you will want this Mother Teresa of Calcutta: A Personal Portrait.

Alejandro Koenig:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As you
may know that book is very important normally. The book Mother Teresa of Calcutta: A Personal Portrait
ended up being making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information.
It is quite advantages for you. The guide Mother Teresa of Calcutta: A Personal Portrait is not only giving
you more new information but also to become your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your spend
time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship with the book Mother Teresa of Calcutta: A Personal
Portrait. You never feel lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Ross Adams:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Studying a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Mother Teresa of Calcutta: A Personal
Portrait book since this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the information in this
book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Kristi Duncan:

Reading a book for being new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you study a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, since book has
a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that you have
read. If you need to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and also soon. The Mother
Teresa of Calcutta: A Personal Portrait will give you a new experience in reading a book.
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