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Foreword by Nobel laureate Professor Theodor W. Hänsch of Ludwig-Maximilians-Universität München

Based on the authors’ experimental work over the last 25 years, Laser-Based Measurements for Time and
Frequency Domain Applications: A Handbook presents basic concepts, state-of-the-art applications, and
future trends in optical, atomic, and molecular physics. It provides all the background information on the
main kinds of laser sources and techniques, offers a detailed account of the most recent results obtained for
time- and frequency-domain applications of lasers, and develops the theoretical framework necessary for
understanding the experimental applications.

After a historical introduction, the book describes the basic concepts and mathematical tools required for
studying the physics of oscillators. It then discusses microwave and optical resonators, crucial aspects of
operation and fundamental properties of lasers, and precision spectroscopy and absolute frequency
metrology. It also focuses on microwave and optical frequency standards and explores current and potential
research directions.

Accessible to scientists, postdoc researchers, and advanced undergraduate students, this self-contained book
gives a wide-ranging, balanced overview of the areas?including frequency standards and clocks, ultra-high-
precision spectroscopy, quantum information, and environmental metrology?revolutionized by the recent
advent of optical frequency comb synthesizers (OFCSs) based on femtosecond mode-locked lasers. The
book is also a useful guide to cutting-edge research for manufacturers of advanced laser systems and optical
devices.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Gilbert:

Exactly why? Because this Laser-Based Measurements for Time and Frequency Domain Applications: A
Handbook (Series in Optics and Optoelectronics) is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting
for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret that inside. Reading this book close to it was
fantastic author who have write the book in such remarkable way makes the content inside of easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you because of
not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of
positive aspects than the other book get such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking method.
So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were being you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Sandra Williams:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its include may
doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in
the outside look likes. Maybe you answer might be Laser-Based Measurements for Time and Frequency
Domain Applications: A Handbook (Series in Optics and Optoelectronics) why because the amazing cover
that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is
fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Michele Sexton:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This Laser-Based Measurements for Time and Frequency
Domain Applications: A Handbook (Series in Optics and Optoelectronics) can give you a lot of pals because
by you considering this one book you have thing that they don't and make you actually more like an
interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you
information that possibly your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than additional make you to be
great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let us have Laser-Based Measurements for Time and Frequency
Domain Applications: A Handbook (Series in Optics and Optoelectronics).

Maurice Conner:

As a student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's spirit or
real their hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there
but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on



this age, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this Laser-Based Measurements for Time and Frequency Domain Applications: A Handbook
(Series in Optics and Optoelectronics) can make you feel more interested to read.
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