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In a lyrical mix of natural science, history, and memoir, Melissa L. Sevigny ponders what it means to make a
home in the American Southwest at a time when its most essential resource, water, is overexploited and
undervalued. Mythical River takes the reader on a historical sojourn into the story of the Buenaventura, an
imaginary river that led eighteenth- and nineteenth-century explorers, fur trappers, and emigrants astray for
seventy-five years. This mythical river becomes a metaphor for our modern-day attempts to supply water to a
growing population in the Colorado River Basin. Readers encounter a landscape literally remapped by the
search for “new” water, where rivers flow uphill, dams and deep wells reshape geography, trees become
intolerable competitors for water, and new technologies tap into clouds and oceans.

In contrast to this fantasy of abundance, Sevigny explores acts of restoration. From a dismantled dam in
Arizona to an accidental wetland in Mexico, she examines how ecologists, engineers, politicians, and
citizens have attempted to secure water for desert ecosystems. In a place scarred by conflict, she shows how
recognizing the rights of rivers is a path toward water security. Ultimately, Sevigny writes a new map for the
future of the American Southwest, a vision of a society that accepts the desert’s limits in exchange for an
intimate relationship with the natural world. 
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From reader reviews:

Marilyn Daniels:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may know
that book is very important for all of us. The book Mythical River: Chasing the Mirage of New Water in the
American Southwest has been making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more
information. It is very advantages for you. The reserve Mythical River: Chasing the Mirage of New Water in
the American Southwest is not only giving you much more new information but also being your friend when
you sense bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship
while using book Mythical River: Chasing the Mirage of New Water in the American Southwest. You never
experience lose out for everything if you read some books.

Elliott Salazar:

The book Mythical River: Chasing the Mirage of New Water in the American Southwest will bring you to
the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. Should you try
to find new book to study, this book very acceptable to you. The book Mythical River: Chasing the Mirage
of New Water in the American Southwest is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-
book through the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Ellis Dunn:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to share.
You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You can
observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to you
personally is Mythical River: Chasing the Mirage of New Water in the American Southwest this e-book
consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented how
does the world has grown up. The words styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often
the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book suitable all of you.

Elijah McWhorter:

Is it an individual who having spare time after that spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Mythical River: Chasing the Mirage
of New Water in the American Southwest can be the solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are
so out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So
what these textbooks have than the others?
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