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Nearly twenty years ago, Robin Hobb burst upon the fantasy scene with the first of her acclaimed Farseer
novels, Assassin’s Apprentice, which introduced the characters of FitzChivalry Farseer and his uncanny
friend the Fool. A watershed moment in modern fantasy, this novel—and those that followed—broke
exciting new ground in a beloved genre. Together with George R. R. Martin, Robin Hobb helped pave the
way for such talented new voices as Scott Lynch, Brandon Sanderson, and Naomi Novik.
 
Over the years, Hobb’s imagination has soared throughout the mythic lands of the Six Duchies in such
bestselling series as the Liveship Traders Trilogy and the Rain Wilds Chronicles. But no matter how far she
roamed, her heart always remained with Fitz. And now, at last, she has come home, with an astonishing new
novel that opens a dark and gripping chapter in the Farseer saga.
 
FitzChivalry—royal bastard and former king’s assassin—has left his life of intrigue behind. As far as the rest
of the world knows, FitzChivalry Farseer is dead and buried. Masquerading as Tom Badgerlock, Fitz is now
married to his childhood sweetheart, Molly, and leading the quiet life of a country squire.
 
Though Fitz is haunted by the disappearance of the Fool, who did so much to shape Fitz into the man he has
become, such private hurts are put aside in the business of daily life, at least until the appearance of
menacing, pale-skinned strangers casts a sinister shadow over Fitz’s past . . . and his future.
 
Now, to protect his new life, the former assassin must once again take up his old one. . . .

Praise for Fool’s Assassin
 
“Hobb knows the complicated workings of the wayward human heart, and she takes time to depict them in
her tale, to tell her story sweetly, insistently, compellingly. . . . A book meant to be inhabited rather than run
through.”—The Seattle Times
 
“[FitzChivalry Farseer is] one of the best characters in fantasy literature.”—Fantasy Book Review
 
“[Hobb’s] prose sparkles, her characters leap off the page.”—Tor.com
 
“Modern fantasy at its irresistible best.”—The Guardian
 
“Fantastic . . . emotionally rich storytelling.”—Library Journal (starred review)

Praise for Robin Hobb
 
“Fantasy as it ought to be written . . . Robin Hobb’s books are diamonds in a sea of zircons.”—George R. R.
Martin



From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Jesse Reid:

Often the book Fool's Assassin: Book I of the Fitz and the Fool Trilogy has a lot associated with on it. So
when you read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very famous author.
The author makes some research before write this book. This book very easy to read you can obtain the point
easily after perusing this book.

Irene Howe:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book mainly book
entitled Fool's Assassin: Book I of the Fitz and the Fool Trilogy the mind will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can become your mind friends.
Imaging just about every word written in a guide then become one application form conclusion and
explanation that maybe you never get just before. The Fool's Assassin: Book I of the Fitz and the Fool
Trilogy giving you one more experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful facts for
your better life in this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind are
going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this
extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Leonard Vega:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Attempt
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its protect may doesn't work at
this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer is usually Fool's Assassin: Book I of the Fitz and the Fool Trilogy
why because the great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint an individual.
The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly
direct you to pick up this book.

Judith Ellis:

The book untitled Fool's Assassin: Book I of the Fitz and the Fool Trilogy contain a lot of information on it.
The writer explains your ex idea with easy way. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do
certainly not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was published by famous author. The author provides
you in the new age of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can continue reading your
smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go through.
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